

MEMORANDUM

TO: Mayor Patrick Collins, and City Council
FROM: TJ Barttelbort, Purchasing Manager 
DATE: January 8, 2025
SUBJECT: Consideration of Bid #E-10-25 for One (1) Front Load Refuse Truck, and Three (3) Dual Arm Refuse Trucks for the Sanitation Division

Bid #E-10-25 was solicited for One (1) Front Load Refuse Truck, and Three (3) Dual Arm Refuse Trucks for the Sanitation Division.

One (1) bidder responded to this bid, and the bid tabulation is attached. The Bid was received from:

1. Cheyenne Peterbilt Inc. Jackson Group Peterbilt, Cheyenne, Wyoming

The bid was reviewed by Vicki Nemecek (Public Works), Craig LaVoy (Public Works), Austin Reiner (Sanitation), and Bryan Bell (Fleet Maintenance), and their recommendation is to accept the lowest responsive bid from Cheyenne Peterbilt Inc. Jackson Group Peterbilt.

Cheyenne Peterbilt Inc. Jackson Group Peterbilt submitted two (2) pricing options for the Front Load Style Trucks. Their 'Option 1' submittal did not meet the minimum requirements for the specifications, so it will not be considered.

The total Bid Award is for \$2,038,492.00 (Purchase of 4 Trucks, Less Trades).

Funding: 023-14-1417-43-43102 (Solid Waste Fund / Equipment)

FRONT LOAD REFUSE TRUCK					CHEYENNE PETERBILT INC. JACKSON GROUP PETERBILT		
Selected	Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total	Make / Model / Year / Body Info
	OPTION 1						
X	1	Front Load Refuse Truck	1	EACH	\$439,969.00	\$439,969.00	520 Pete Wittke
	OPTION 2						
X	2	Front Load Refuse Truck	1	EACH	\$452,000.00	\$452,000.00	520 Pete Newway
	OPTION 3						
X	3	Front Load Refuse Truck	1	EACH	No Bid	No Bid	
	NO TRADE IN!						
		Total				\$452,000.00	
DUAL ARM REFUSE TRUCKS					CHEYENNE PETERBILT INC. JACKSON GROUP PETERBILT		
Selected	Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total	Make / Model / Year / Body Info
	OPTION 1						
X	1	Dual Arm Refuse Truck	3	EACH	\$562,164.00	\$1,686,492.00	520 Pete Labrie
	OPTION 2						
X	2	Dual Arm Refuse Truck	3	EACH	No Bid	No Bid	
	OPTION 3						
X	3	Dual Arm Refuse Truck	3	EACH	No Bid	No Bid	
	TRADE INS						
X	4	Trade In. Block #5866. 2013 Peterbilt 320, Dual Arm ASL	1	EACH	(\$30,000.00)	(\$30,000.00)	
X	5	Trade In. Block #5895. 2015 Peterbilt 320, Dual Arm ASL	1	EACH	(\$35,000.00)	(\$35,000.00)	
X	6	Trade In. Block #5896. 2015 Peterbilt 320, Dual Arm ASL	1	EACH	(\$35,000.00)	(\$35,000.00)	
		Total				\$1,586,492.00	
					Grand Total	\$ 2,038,492.00	

TJB